UNITED IRRIGATION DISTRICT

Pump Station E4538
Bid Opening Tuesday, August 27, 2024, 2P

Contractor: United Water Services,

LLC.

Contractor: R.P. Constructors, Inc.

Contractor: JMJ Constructors

Contractor: Foremost Paving, Inc.

Contractor: Mor-Wil LLC.

Contractor; GO Underground LLC.

Contractor: Jimenez Engineering
Solutions (ICE)

Bid Schedule A - Texas Water Development Board Funded ltems

Bid ltem

Qty

Units

Description

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

LS.

Development and implementation of Stormwater
Pollution Prevention Plan in accordance with
construction plans and specifications for the lump
sum price of:

$3,248.00

$3,248.00

$8,000.00

$8,000.00

$8,000.00

$8,000.00

$3,000.00

$3,000.00

$21,000.00

$21,000.00

$46,000.00

$46,000.00

$50,000.00

$50,000.00

L.S.

Construction of Pump Station including excavation,
forming, waterstop, backfill, piping, rebar, structural
steel, installation of pumps and electric motors, and
any other incidentals necessary in accordance with
construction plans and specifications for the lump
sum price of:

$395,000.00

$395,000.00

$220,000.00

$220,000.00

$214,300.00

$214,300.00

$484,000.00

$484,000.00

$422,919.03

$422,919.03

$740,000.00

$740,000.00

$709,000.00

$709,000.00

Design and construction of 7' diameter, 90 tail
Welded Steel Standpipe to include a concrete
foundation, welded inlet piping with flanged
connection for yard piping, welded dischage piping
with flanged connection for yard piping, welded
overflow piping with flanged connection for yard
piping, ladders,two (2) 30 inch manways, roof vent,
handrail, antenna mount, coating, and any other
incidentals necessary in accordance with
construction plans and specifications for the lump
sum price of:

$487,450.00

$487,450.00

$420,000.00

$420,000.00

$438,145.00

$438,145.00

$400,000.00

$400,000.00

$350,000.00

$350,000.00

$381,900.00

$381,900.00

$796,000.00

$796,000.00

L.S.

Construction of Intake Stucture including piping,
concrete headwall, excavation, forming, rebar,
structural steel, waterstop, backfill, barscreen,
canal repair, furnishing and installation of fabricated
stainless steel slide gate, and any other incidentals
necessary in accordance with the construction
plans and specifications for the lump sum price of:

$97,984.00

$97,984.00

$76,000.00

$76,000.00

$136,800.00

$136,800.00

$150,000.00

$150,000.00

$111,650.00

$111,650.00

$160,808.00

$160,808.00

$277,500.00

$277,500.00

LS.

Furnish and install all piping, other than 24 inch
piping, in accordance with construction plans and
specifications to include fittings, supports,
polywrap, pipe bedding, and any other incidentals
necessary for the lump sum price of:

$110,916.00

$110,916.00

$400,000.00

$400,000.00

$368,900.00

$368,900.00

$430,000.00

$430,000.00

$507,144.02

$507,144.02

$462,245.73

$462,245.73

$350,000.00

$350,000.00

147

L.F.

Implementation of Trench Safety System for piping
for trenches deeper than four (4) feet, other than 24
inch piping in accordance with the specifications
per linear foot:

$25.00

$3,675.00

$1.00

$147.00

$54.42

$7,999.74

$1.00

$147.00

$142.86

$21,000.42

$20.00

$2,940.00

$50.00

$7,350.00

2645

SY.

Hydromulch of all disturbed areas in accordance
with specifications for the unit price of:

$7.00

$18,515.00

$1.00

$2,645.00

$4.54

$12,008.30

$1.00

$2,645.00

$13.23

$34,993.35

$8.00

$21,160.00

$2.00

$5,290.00

74.5

1,000
gal.

Watering at the rate of one half inch (1/2") per day
for ten (10) days in accordance with specifications
for the unit price of :

$38.00

$2,831.00

$50.00

$3,725.00

$134.00

$9,983.00

$80.00

$5,960.00

$375.84

$28,000.08

$80.00

$5,960.00

$100.00

$7,450.00

L.S.

Furnish and install all electrical wiring, fixtures and
components in accordance with construction plans
and specifications, and any other incidentals
necessary for the lump sum price of:

$320,000.00

$320,000.00

$420,000.00

$420,000.00

$444,000.00

$444,000.00

$360,000.00

$360,000.00

$637,000.00

$637,000.00

$442,500.00

$442,500.00

$600,000.00

$600,000.00

LS.

Furnish and install all Supervisory Contral And Data
Acquisition (SCADA) components in accordance
with construction plans and specifications, and any
other incidentals necessary for the lump sum price

of:

$93,720.00

$93,720.00

$100,000.00

$100,000.00

$68,900.00

$68,900.00

$90,000.00

$90,000.00

$138,208.00

$138,208.00

$80,000.00

$80,000.00

$1562,000.00

$152,000.00

202-065
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UNITED IRRIGATION DISTRICT

Pump Station E458
Bid Opening Tuesday, August 27, 2024, 2P

Contractor: United Water Services,

LLC.

Contractor: R.P. Constructors, Inc.

Contractor: JMJ Constructors

Contractor: Foremost Paving, Inc.

Contractor: Mor-Wil LLC.

Contractor: GO Underground LLC.

Contractor: Jimenez Engineering
Solutions (ICE)

461.65

SY.

Construct 6" thick caliche paving including 6"
subgrade compacted to 95% standard proctor
density for the unit price of:

$80.00

$36,932.00

$16.00

$7,386.40

$18.00

$8,309.70

$30.00

$13,849.50

$36.39

$16,799.44

$23.68

$10,931.87

$20.00

$9,233.00

L.S.

Site grading, fencing, cleanup, and any other work
required but not included in Bid Items 1-11in
accordance with construction plans and
specifications for the lump sum price of:

$49,733.00

$49,733.00

$60,000.00

$60,000.00

$35,000.00

$35,000.00

$35,000.00

$35,000.00

$42,000.00

$42,000.00

$65,000.00

$65,000.00

$100,000.00

$100,000.00

Total Amount Bid Schedule A:

$1,620,004.00

$1,717,903.40

$1,752,345.74

$1,974,601.50

$2,330,714.34

$2,419,445.60

$3,063,823.00

Alternate Bid Schedule A

Bid ltem

Qty

Units

Description

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

L.S.

Deduction for deletion of U.S. Iron & Steel
Requirements specified in Division 00950 for Bid
Schedule A for the lump sum deduct of:

$29,300.00

$29,300.00

$140,000.00

$140,000.00

$80,000.00

$80,000.00

$123,000.00

$123,000.00

$79,200.00

$79,200.00

$100,412.13

$100,412.13

$130,000.00

$130,000.00

Total Amount Bid Schedule A with Deduct for Alternate Bid

Schedule A:|

$1,590,704.00!

$1,577,903.40

$1,672,345.74

$1,851,601.50

$2,251,514.34

$2,319,033.47

$2,933,823.00

Bid Schedule B - U.S. Bureau of Reclamation Funding - 24"

Pipeline

Bid ltem

Qty

Units

Description

Unit Price

Total Price

343

L.F.

Furnish and install 24 inch C900 CL100 PVC
pipeline in accordance with construction plans and
specifications, and any other incidentals necessary
for the lump sum price of:

$355.00

$121,765.00

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

$175.00

$60,025.00

$151.00

$51,793.00

$220.00

$75,460.00

$153.94

$52,801.42

$149.83

$51,391.69

$200.00

$68,600.00

343

L.F.

Implementation of Trench Safety System for piping
for trenches deeper than four (4) feet in accordance
with the specifications for the unit price of:

$34.00

$11,662.00

$1.00

$343.00

$54.42

$18,666.06

$1.00

$343.00

$19.24

$6,5699.32

$10.00

$3,430.00

$20.00

$6,860.00

L.S.

Connect to existing 24 inch PIP, 100PS| PVC
pipeline with transition coupling in accordance with
construction plans and specifications for the lump
sum price of:

$10,093.00

$10,093.00

$6,000.00

$6,000.00

$7,800.00

$7,800.00

$8,000.00

$8,000.00

$8,109.95

$8,109.95

$9,143.90

$9,143.90

$7,600.00

$7,500.00

L.S.

Furnish and install meter vault including well, top,
gravel foundation, PVC flange, flanged coupling
adapters, magnetic meter, and any other
incidentals necessary in accordance with
construction plans and specifications for the lump
sum price of:

$53,382.00

$53,382.00

$35,000.00

$35,000.00

$86,400.00

$86,400.00

$87,000.00

$87,000.00

$85,936.98

$85,936.98

$103,103.77

$103,103.77

$90,000.00

$90,000.00

ea.

Furnish and install 24 inch x 20 inch mechanical
joint tee with megalugs and polywrap in accordance
with construction plans and specifications for the
unit price of:

$12,629.00

$12,629.00

$8,500.00

$8,500.00

$11,830.00

$11,830.00

$12,000.00

$12,000.00

$12,188.09

$12,188.09

$8,933.40

$8,933.40

$10,000.00

$10,000.00

ea.

Furnish and install 24 inch motor-operated butterfly
valve in accordance with construction plans and
specifications for the unit price of:

$10,612.00

$10,512.00

$65,000.00

$65,000.00

$75,000.00

$75,000.00

$70,000.00

$70,000.00

$76,663.13

$76,663.13

$71,078.13

$71,078.13

$85,000.00

$85,000.00

L.S.

Furnish and install 24 inch x 12 inch tee,
mechanical joint, with megalugs and polywrap in
accordance with construction plans and
specifications for the lump sum price of:

$4,371.00

$4,371.00

$8,500.00

$8,500.00

$10,400.00

$10,400.00

$12,000.00

$12,000.00

$12,402.90

$12,402.90

$10,396.14

$10,396.14

$12,000.00

$12,000.00

ea.

Furnish and install 24 inch 45 degree bend, flange x
mechanical joint with megalugs and polywrap in
accordance with construction plans and
specifcations for the unit price of:

$5,164.00

$5,164.00

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

$8,2565.00

$8,255.00

$12,000.00

$12,000.00

$8,550.88

$8,550.88

$6,177.94

$6,177.94

$8,000.00

$8,000.00

1

ea.

Furnish and install 24 inch 22.5 degree bend,
mechanical joint, in accordance with the
construction plans and specifications for the unit

price of:

$6,906.00

$6,906.00

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

$6,500.00

$6,500.00

$9,000.00

$9,000.00

$8,288.69

$8,288.69

$5,979.31

$5,979.31

$5,000.00

$5,000.00

202-065
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UNITED IRRIGATION DISTRICT

Pump Station E458

Bid Opening Tuesday, August 27, 2024, 2P

Contractor: United Water Services, Contractor: R.P. Constructors, Inc. Contractor: JMJ Constructors Contractor: Foremost Paving, Inc. Contractor: Mor-Wil LLC. Contractor: GO Underground LLC. Contractor: Jimenez Engineering
LLC. Solutions (ICE)
Furnish and install 24 inch 90 degree bend,
10 1 ea. |flanged, in accordance with the construction plans
and specifications for the unit price of: $6,424.00 $6,424.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $15,400.00 $15,400.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $16,031.90 $16,031.90 $11,845.38 $11,845.38 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
Furnish and install 24 inch ductile iron spool,
flanged, at canal bank in accordance with
11 1 L.S. - PR
construction plans and specifications for the lump ‘
sum price of: $12,318.00 $12,318.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $17,251.62 $17,251.62 $13,369.41 $13,369.41 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
Repair concrete lined canal at 24 inch penetration
into Bryan canal to include welded wire
12 1 L.S. |reinforcement, and concrete in accordance with
construction plans and specifications for the lump
sum price of: $10,392.00 $10,392.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
Total Amount Bid Schedule B: $265,618.00 $217,368.00 $312,544.06 $320,803.00 $370,824.88 $326,849.07 $372,960.00
Proposed Time of Completion of Base Bid A+B is longer than contract T
specified Time of Completion of 270 Calendar Days. 365 270 365 270 270 |
Proposed Alternate Time of Completion of Alternate Bid Schedule A for
deletion of US Iron and Steel Requirements is constructed. 365 270 365 270 270
Alternate SCADA System Contractor (§SC) .
Bid ltem| Qty | Units Description Unit Price Total Price | Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Furnish and Install alt Supervisory and Control and
Data Acquisition components in accordance with
construction plans and specifications, utilizing the
SSC named below, and in accordance with the
attached information that identifies equipment and
software for the new instrumentation and RTU. The
10A 1 L.S. |bid shall include a descritpion of experience with No Bid No Bid $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $68,900.00 $68,900.00 No Bid No Bid $118,000.00 $118,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
the existing United SCADA Operation System,
radio telemetry, the names of the personnel that will
perform the programming, their location, and a list
of referenced in south Texas where the SSC has
provided SCADA services and regularly provides
SCADA services, for the lump sum price of:
Named SCADA System Contractor: Municipal Pump & Control, Inc. Municipal Pump & Control, Inc. Municipal Pump & Control, Inc.
Total Amount of Bid Schedule A, substituting Item 10 for ltem
10A: No Bid $1,677,903.40 $1,752,345.74 No Bid $2,310,506.34 No Bid No Bid
Total Amount Bid Schedules A & B: $1,885,622.00 $1,935,271.40 $2,064,889.80 $2,295,404.50 $2,701,539.22 $2,746,294.67 $3,436,783.00
Total Amount Bid Schedules A & B w/ Alt. Bid Schedule A Deduct: $1,856,322.00 $1,795,271.40 $1,984,889.80 $2,172,404.50 $2,622,339.22 $2,645,882.54 $3,306,783.00
Total Amount Bid Schedules A & B w/ ltem 10A Substitution: No Bid $1,895,271.40 $2,064,889.80 No Bid $2,681,331.22 No Bid No Bid
Total Amount Bid Schedules A & B w/ Alt. Bid Schedule A Deduct and ltem
10A Substitution No Bid 7 $1,755,271.40 $1,984,889.80 No Bid $2,602,131.22 No Bid No Bid
T ST
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