440-008

BASE BID- East Main Canal - Bi-Weekly shutdowns and/or Gravity Bypass

Bid Tabulation
Donna Irrigation District
Concrete Paving of the East Main Canal and the North Crossover Main Canal

Bid Opening Tuesday, September 24, 2024 @ 3P

Contractor:

Mor-Wil, LLC

Contractor:

GO Underground, LLC

Contractor:

RBM Contractors, LLC

Contractor:

Foremost Paving, Inc.

Item

Qty

Units

Description

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

LS

Placement of Cofferdams, dewatering and removal of debris from canal in preparation
for lining for the lump sum of price of:

$ 55,594.00

$ 55,594.00

$ 105,125.00

$ 105,125.00

$ 90,396.52

$ 90,396.52

$ 500.00

$ 500.00

25,775

SF

Removal of broken sections of the existing canal liner in locations determined by the
engineer, particularly those sections that might damage the new liner or that have
obvious voids below the liner, and disposal of the removed concrete liner an the
District Reservoir for the unit price of:

$ 2.72

$ 70,108.00

$ 5.33

$ 137,380.75

$ 12.51

$ 322,445.25

$ 3.50

$ 90,212.50

954

CcY

Furnish and install cement stabilized sand (1% sacks per cubic yard) to fill voids in
existing liner where existing liner is missing or uneven to top of existing liner grade for
the unit price of:

$ 90.99

$ 86,804.46

$ 120.00

$ 114,480.00

$ 223.17

$ 212,904.18

$ 220.00

$ 209,880.00

257,754

SF

Install Owner supplied 8-20-8 Huesker Liner, including labor and equipment to place
liner perpendicular to canal centerline, including welding of seams with hot melting
glue, using Owner supplied melting glue, and Owner supplied glue melter,
construction of top trench, Contractor supplied brick chairs#4 rebar in top beam
including 20" splice length, welded wire reinforcement, 4x4 - 6/6, including use of 2.5"
Bar-Lift yellow chairs to maintain -adequate clearance and support, bending of welded
wire at top trench and splicing of overlap, measured as finished area from the outside
top of top beam to opposite outside edge of top beam, for the unit price of:

$ 1.78

$ 458,802.12

$ 2.20

$ 567,058.80

$ 814,502.64

$ 3.60

$ 927,914.40

3,770

LF

Furnish and Install expansion joints, measured from the outside top of beam to
opposite outside top of beam, including custom cut 4"x3/4" fiber expansion joint,
3/4"x2" PVC cap seal using, sheet metal screws in accordance with the plans and
specifications for the unit price of:

$ 24.23

$ 91,347.10

$ 8.64

$ 32,5672.80

$ 3.65

$ 13,760.50

$ 20.00

$ 75,400.00

217,404

SF

Furnish and install 3,500 psi concrete in accordance with the plans and specifications,
with a heavy broom finish at an average thickness of 4" but not less than 3", measured
from the outside top of top beam along the canal perimeter to the opposite top of top
beam, for the unit price of:

$ 5.14

$  1,117,456.56

$ 5.82

$ 1,265,291.28

$ 4.52

$ 982,666.08

$ 9.59

$ 2,084,904.36

516

LF

Furnish and install steel batten strips with galvanized anchors at ends of Huesker
Liner around gate penetrations and locations where liner is not used, on vertical
surfaces, as directed by the Engineer for the unit price of:

$ 119.38

$ 61,600.08

il

22.00

$ 11,352.00

$ 34.22

$ 17,657.52

$ 30.00

$ 156,480.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

1,941,712.32

2,233,260.63

2,454,332.69

3,404,291.26

ALTERNATE BID 6A - SHOTCRETE for East Main Canal

Item

Qty

Units Description

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

6A

217,404

SF

Furnish and install 4,000 psi shotcrete, unfinished except for a heavy broom finish on
the top beams and along the expansion joints at an average thickness of 4" and not
less than 3", for the unit price of:

$ 4.62

$ 1,004,406.48

No Bid

No Bid

$ 8.69

$ 1,889,240.76

No Bid

No Bid

TOTAL AMOUNT SHOTCRETE BID SCHEDULE = TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID, LESS ITEM 6, PLUS ITEM 6A

1,828,662.24

No Bid

$ 3,360,907.37

No Bid
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440-008

BASE BID- North Crossover Main Canal with Owner Bypassing Operation

Bid Tabulation

Donna Irrigation District
Concrete Paving of the East Main Canal and the North Crossover Main Canal
Bid Opening Tuesday, September 24, 2024 @ 3P

Contractor:

Contractor:

Mor-Wil, LLC

Contractor:

Contractor:

GO Underground, LLC

RBM Contractors, LLC

Foremost Paving, Inc.

Item

Qty

Units

Description

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

LS

Placement of Cofferdams, dewatering and removal of debris from canal in preparation
for lining for the lump sum of price of:

45,486.00

45,486.00

84,150.00 | $

84,150.00

$

90,396.52 | $

90,396.52

$ 5,000.00 | $

5,000.00

18,269

SF

Removal of broken sections of the existing canal liner in locations determined by the
engineer, particularly those sections that might damage the new liner or that have
obvious voids below the liner, and disposal of the removed concrete liner in the
Districts yard for the unit price of:

2.07

37,816.83

6.28 | §

114,729.32

1251 $

228,545.19

$ 350 $

63,941.50

677

Cy

Furnish and install cement stabilized sand (1% sacks per cubic yard) to fill voids in
existing liner where existing liner is missing or uneven to top of existing liner grade for
the unit price of:

83.15

56,292.55

65.00 | $

44,005.00

9129 | §

61,803.33

$ 22000 %

148,940.00

182,690

SF

Install Owner supplied 8-20-8 Huesker Liner, including labor and equipment to place
liner perpendicular to canal centerline, including welding of seams with hot melting
glue, using Owner supplied melting glue, and Owner supplied glue melter,
construction of top trench, Contractor supplied brick chairs, #4 rebar in top beam
including 20" splice length, welded wire reinforcement, 4x4 - 6/6, 2.5",Bar-Lift yellow
chairs to maintain adequate clearance and support, bending of welded wire at top
trench and splicing of overlap, measured as finished area from the outside top of top
beam to opposite outside edge of top beam, for the unit price of:

2.18

398,264.20

2371 ¢

432,975.30

316 | §

577,300.40

$ 3609

657,684.00

3,000

LF

Furnish and Install expansion joints, measured from the outside top of beam to
opposite outside top of beam, including custom cut 4"x3/4" fiber expansion joint,
3/4"x2" PVC cap seal using, sheet metal screws in accordance with the plans and
specifications for the unit price of:

24.57

73,710.00

864 | %

25,920.00

365 | $

10,950.00

$ 20.00 | $

60,000.00

156,962

SF

Furnish and install 3,500 psi concrete in accordance with the plans and specifications,
with a heavy broom finish at an average thickness of 4" but not less than 3" measured
from the outside top of top beam along the canal perimeter to the opposite top of top
beam, for the unit price of:

5.33

836,607.46

58319

915,088.46

452 %

709,468.24

$ 9809

1,638,227.60

366

LF

Furnish and install steel batten strips with galvanized anchors at ends of Huesker
Liner around gate penetrations and locations where liner is not used, on vertical
surfaces, as directed by the Engineer for the unit price of:

Lzl

126.23

46,200.18

&2

2200 %

8,052.00

3422 | %

12,524.52

$ 30001 %

10,980.00

TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID

1,494,377.22

1,624,920.08

1,690,988.20

2,484,773.10

ALTERNATE BID 6A - SHOTCRETE for North Crossover Main Canal

Item

Qty

Units

Description

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

B6A

156,962

SF

Furnish and install 4,000 psi shotcrete, unfinished except for a heavy broom finish on
the top beams and along the expansion joints at an average thickness of 4" and not
less than 3", for the unit price of:

4.85

761,265.70

No Bid

No Bid

$8.93

$1,401,670.66

No Bid

No Bid

TOTAL AMOUNT SHOTCRETE BID SCHEDULE = TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID, LESS ITEM 6, PLUS ITEM 6A

1,419,035.46

No Bid

$2,383,190.62

No Bid
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440-008

Bid Tabulation
Donna Irrigation District
Concrete Paving of the East Main Canal and the North Crossover Main Canal

Bid Opening Tuesday, September 24, 2024 @ 3P

Contractor: Contractor: Contractor: Contractor:
NORTH CROSSOVER ALTERNATE BID SCHEDULE B - 45 CFS BYPASS Mor-Wil, LLC GO Underground, LLC RBM Contractors, LLC Foremost Paving, Inc.
Item Qty Units  Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Furnish a gravity bypass system using Owner supplied temporary PVC Pipe and lined
temporary canal and/or not less than three bypass pumps, piping, fittings, fuel,
operators and any other incidentals necessary to bypass the work area with a total
capacity of not less than forty-five cubic feet per second (20,200 gallons per minute)
and a minimum flow of 8 cubic feet per second, including an instantaneous flowmeter
B1 1 LS |that reads flowrate in cubic feet per second, for the lump sum price of: N/A N/A No Bid No Bid $ 2,887,636.91| % 2,887,63691] 9% 462,000.00 | $ 462,000.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BASE BID + ITEM B1 N/A No Bid $ 4,578,625.11 | $ 2,946,773.10
Alternate Bid Schedule C for Construction Contract
Installation of Gates
Bid Iten]  Qty Units Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Installation of 36" wide x 36" tall fabricated stainless steel slide gate with a total height
from the gate of 89.6 inches from the flowline to the centerline of the gear operated lift
supported by the frame, designed for 10 feet of seating head with a rising stem for the
1 2 | Each |unit price of: $ 21,571.84 43,143.68 | $ 18,631.50 37,263.00 | $ 7,469.50 | § 14,939.00 | $ 11,400.00 | $ 22,800.00
Installation of 36" wide x 36" tall fabricated stainless steel slide gate with a total height
from the gate of 101.3 inches from the flowline to the centerline of the gear operated
lift supported by the frame, designed for 10 feet of seating head with a rising stem for
2 2 | Each [the unit price of: $ 22,338.14 44,676.28 | $ 19,187.06 38,374.12 | $ 7,469.50 | $ 14,939.00 | $ 6,400.00 | § 12,800.00
Installation of 36" wide x 36" tall fabricated stainless steel slide gate with a total height
from the gate of 108 inches from the flowline to the centerline of the gear operated lift
supported by the frame, designed for 10 feet of seating head with a rising stem for the
3 2 | Each [|unit price of: $ 22,338.14 44,676.28 | $ 19,187.06 38,374.12 | § 7,469.50 | $ 14,939.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 12,800.00
Installation of 15" fabricated stainless steel canal gate with a frame height from the
center of the pipeline to the top of frame from 5 to 7 feet, round flat back for wall
4 10 | Each |mounting, with handwheel for the unit price of: $ 4,156.10 41,561.00 | § 11,116.67 111,166.70 | $ 6,844.43 | $ 68,444.30 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 36,000.00
Manufacture and deliver 15" fabricated stainless steel or cast iron canal gate with a
frame height from the center of the pipeline to the top of frame from 7 to 9 feet, round
5 10 | Each |[flat back for wall mounting, with handwheel for the unit price of: $ 4,176.65 41,766.50 | $ 11,792.12 117,921.20 | $ 6,844.43 | $ 68,444.30 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 36,000.00
Installation of 18" fabricated stainless steel or cast iron canal gate with a frame height
from the center of the pipeline to the top of frame from 7 to 9 feet, round flat back for
6 1| Each |wall mounting, with handwheel for the unit price of: $ 10,813.07 10,813.07 [ $ 11,335.56 11,335.56 | $ 6,969.45 | $ 6,969.45 | § 3,600.00 | $ 3,600.00
Installation of 24" fabricated stainless steel or cast iron canal gate with a frame height
from the center of the pipeline to the top of frame from 7 to 9 feet, round flat back for
7 1| Each |wall mounting, with handwheel for the unit price of: $ 15,117.14 15,117.14 | $ 13,954.45 13,954.45 | 7,156.96 | $ 7,156.96 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 7,200.00
Construction of overflow and drain structure at the East Main Canal, station 116+74,
including excavation, backfill, foundation, precast Type C-C Inlet in two sections,
installation of Owner supplied downward opening weir gate and canal gate for
drainage, C-channel, galvanized grating and any other incidentals necessary for the
8 1| L.S. [lump sum price of: $ 180,456.47 180,456.47 | § 47,767.00 47,767.00 | $ 28,439.63 | $ 28,439.63 | § 22,800.00 | $ 22,800.00
TOTAL AMOUNT BID Alternate Bid Schedule C | $ 422,21042 | § 416,156.15 | $ 224,271.64 | $ 154,000.00
Certified as Correct By: *ltems italicized in red are mathematical errors corrected by Ferris, Flinn & Medina, LLC.,
FERRIS, FLINN & MEDINA, LLC
TBPE Firm No. F-897 LT
[ T 2.2$H 2K, OF T,
Frank A. Ferris, PE / ﬂ Date 3;,“: '«:’".. oo %
/ ; o’ %o -
? *.o .Q* -
* . ‘. -
LR ] l.'.’l."'ﬂ"...l....'~
-
- .O.IC..’.‘Q‘.I..Q.....‘
.3, 70724 s
-»
' @ .'- o“ c‘} L
& ®ee " E\\
., ONAL

Construction Bid Tabulation 3 of 3

9/25/2024



